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INSTRUCTIONS FOR USE  
 

 

FULL BODY CUSHION 
FOR CYBERKNIFE 
COUCH TOP 
 
 
 
Article No. : 32118
 
A. GENERAL PRODUCT INFORMATION 

The products referred to in these instructions are medical 
devices, used for patient positioning and immobilisation in 
radiation therapy. 

To attain an optimal result, it is recommended to use this 
product in combination with Orfit immobilisation products.  

B. PRODUCT DESCRIPTION 

The cushion is designed to use on a Cyberknife for spinal 
treatment. The patient is positioned supine on the cushion with 
the arms along the side of the body. Due to the narrow width of 
the cushion, the arms will be positioned next to the cushion on 
the treatment table, instead of on top of the cushion. This 
allows the use of lateral fields to radiate the spine without the 
arms being located in the treatment field. 
  

 
 

 

C. PROPERTIES 

The cushion is manufactured from a Polyether foam. 

Dimensions: L 2100mm x W 330mm x H 100mm 

Weight:  6.24 kg 

Density:  90 kg/m3 

D. STORAGE 

Always store the product in a safe place to prevent it from 
getting damaged. Do not put heavy objects on the cushion and 
prevent hard objects from falling onto it, because these will 
cause permanent deformations. Make sure that no sharp 
objects can come into contact with this cushion. 
Store the cushions between +10°C (50°F) and 40°C (122°F). 

E. MAINTENANCE AND WASTE MANAGEMENT 

These products can be cleaned and disinfected by means of an 
isopropanol or ethanol based disinfectant, applied with a soft 
cloth. If unsure about the cleaning fluid, do not use. Never use 
aerosol sprays, corrosive cleaning agents, solvents or abrasive 
detergents. Do not soak the cushion. Further cleaning 
instructions can be found in the Orfit Cleaning Guidelines.  
Contact your distributor if there are any questions or concerns. 

F. ADDITIONAL INFORMATION 

For additional information such as distributor contact 
information, product brochures, Safety Data Sheets and 
regulatory information, please visit our website www.orfit.com.  
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